

COUNTY OF BARNSTABLE GASOLINE and DIESEL FUEL - FY2020
July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2020

| FIXED PRICE - DIESEL | | | | | | |
|---|----------------|-----------------|---------------|--------------------------|--------------------|-------------------|
| SECTION | Sprague | Diesel D | Noonan | Petroleum Traders | CC Biofuels | East River |
| Section 1: Barnstable Dept. of Public Works | 2.3254 | 2.3153 | 2.27 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 3: Barnstable Golf Courses | 2.3262 | 2.3153 | 2.37 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 4: Barnstable Municipal Airport | 2.3054 | 2.3153 | 2.29 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 5: Barnstable School Department | 2.2832 | 2.3153 | 2.27 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 7: Town of Bourne, a, b | 2.2388 | 2.3353 | 2.27 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 7: Town of Bourne, d,e, ISWM | 2.2762 | 2.3353 | 2.37 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 8: Town of Brewster | 2.3054 | 2.3353 | 2.29 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 10: Town of Chatham | 2.2889 | 2.4453 | 2.29 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 11: Town of Dennis | 2.3146 | 2.3153 | 2.27 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 12: Dennis Water District | 2.3262 | 2.3153 | 2.29 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 14: Town of Eastham | 2.3054 | 2.3953 | 2.29 | No bid | 2.349 | No bid |
| Section 15: Town of Falmouth | 2.2344 | 2.3353 | 2.27 | 2.3242* | No bid | No bid |
| Section 16: Town of Harwich | 2.2948 | 2.3353 | 2.27 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 18: Town of Mashpee | 2.3054 | 2.3353 | 2.27 | No bid | 2.329 | No bid |
| Section 19: Town of Orleans | 2.3054 | 2.3953 | 2.27 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 20: Town of Sandwich | 2.3112 | 2.3353 | 2.27 | No bid | 2.329 | No bid |
| Section 22: Upper Cape Regional Technical | 2.2754 | 2.3353 | 2.29 | No bid | 2.329 | No bid |
| Section 23: Town of Wellfleet | 2.4254 | 2.3953 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid |

*Vendor submitted a conditional bid – would only accept Falmouth if they won both gas and diesel

| OEP ULS DIESEL | | | | | | |
|--|----------------|----------------------|---------------|--------------------|--------------------|-------------------|
| | Sprague | Diesel Direct | Noonan | Pet Traders | CC Biofuels | East River |
| Section 6: Barnstable County Dredge | .1704 | .20 | .08 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 9: Centerville/Osterville/MM Fire | .1696 | .14 | .08 | No bid | .145 | .2512 |
| Section 13: Dennis Yarmouth Regional School District | .1696 | .12 | .0793 | No bid | .145 | .2012 |
| | | | | | | |
| Section 21: Town of Truro | .1696 | .1455 | No bid | No bid | .145 | No Bid |
| Section 24: Town of Yarmouth | .1462 | .12 | .0793 | No bid | .145 | .2312 |

| FIXED PRICE GASOLINE | | | | | | |
|---|----------------|----------------|---------------|--------------------|--------------------|-------------------|
| | Sprague | DDirect | Noonan | Pet Traders | CC Biofuels | East River |
| Section 1: Barnstable Dept. of Public Works | 1.9804 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 2: Barnstable Police Department | 1.9804 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 3: Barnstable Golf Courses | 2.0404 | No bid | 2.063 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 4: Barnstable Municipal Airport | 2.0104 | No bid | 1.983 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 5: Barnstable School Department | 2.0404 | No bid | 1.983 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 7: Town of Bourne, locations a,b | 1.9837 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 8: Town of Brewster | 2.0604 | No bid | 1.983 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 10: Town of Chatham | 2.0104 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 11: Town of Dennis | 2.0228 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 14: Town of Eastham | 2.0104 | No bid | 1.983 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 15: Town of Falmouth | 1.9394 | No bid | 1.963 | 1.8916 * | No bid | No bid |
| Section 16: Town of Harwich | 2.0104 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 18: Town of Mashpee | 1.9394 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 19: Town of Orleans | 2.0104 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 20: Town of Sandwich | 1.9456 | No bid | 1.963 | 1.9934 | No bid | No bid |
| Section 22: Upper Cape Regional Technical | 1.9804 | No bid | 1.963 | No bid | No bid | No bid |

| OEP REGULAR GASOLINE | | | | | | |
|------------------------------|---------|----------|--------|-------------|-------------|------------|
| | Sprague | D Direct | Noonan | Pet Traders | CC Biofuels | East River |
| Section 9: COMM | .1381 | .10 | .0793 | No bid | No bid | .2112 |
| Section 21: Town of Truro | .1836 | .1455 | No bid | No bid | No bid | No bid |
| Section 24: Town of Yarmouth | .1581 | .12 | .0793 | .1863 | No bid | .2112 |