

Barnstable County Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation Sheet



Bid # 7907

Project: Water Chemicals

Bid Opening Date/Time: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 @ 11:30AM

Vendor Name Address	Non-Collusion	Tax Compliance	Addendum Referenced	Total Price
Coyne Chemical 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021	✓	✓		See attached spreadsheet
NBC Distributors, Inc. 145 Alden Road Fairhaven, MA 02719	✓	✓		↓
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 81 W. Huller Lane Reading, PA 19605	✓	✓	/	
Saybrooke Environmental & Chemical 111 Tosca Drive Stoughton, MA 02072	✓	✓		
Borden & Remington P.O. Box 2573 Fall River, MA 02722	✓	✓	/	

Listed above are the names of all bidders and the amounts of their bids submitted from vendors for the bid reference above. The undersigned declare under penalties of perjury that this is a complete and accurate list of all bids opened in the presence of the Chief Procurement Officer.

By  4/21/20
 Chief Procurement Officer Date

By via livestream
 Witness Date

Barnstable County Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation Sheet



Bid # 7907

Project: Water Chemicals

Bid Opening Date/Time: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 @ 11:30AM

Vendor Name Address	Non- Collusion	Tax Compliance	Addendum Referenced	Total Price
Univar Solutions 200 Dean Sievers Place Morrisville, PA 19067	✓	✓	1	see spreadsheet

Listed above are the names of all bidders and the amounts of their bids submitted from vendors for the bid reference above. The undersigned declare under penalties of perjury that this is a complete and accurate list of all bids opened in the presence of the Chief Procurement Officer.

By  4/21/20
 Chief Procurement Officer Date

By via livestream
 Witness Date

Bid # 7907 - Water Chemicals

Opened: April 21, 2020 @ 11:30AM

Term: 07/01/2020 - 06/30/2021

Low Bidder	VENDOR					
	Coyne Chemical	NBC Distributors	Brenntag NE, LLC	Saybrooke Environmental	Borden & Remington	Unviar Solutions

CAUSTIC POTASH (POTASSIUM HYDROXIDE – KOH) 45% Solution

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE – LBS.	BID PRICE PER LB					
Barnstable Fire District	200,000			0.3025		0.2475	no bid
Brewster Water Department	319,000			0.3025		0.2699	0.2810
Buzzards Bay Water District	182,500			No Bid		0.3221	no bid
Chatham Water Division	304,000			0.3025		0.2630	0.2690
COMM Water District	800,000			0.3025		0.2499	0.2690
Dennis Water District	750,000			0.3025		0.2507	0.2660
Harwich	139,248			0.3025		0.2516	no bid
Mashpee Water District	150,000			0.3025		0.2738	0.2720
Orleans Water District	203,680			0.3025		0.2720	0.2740
Provincetown Water Department	74,000			0.3025		0.2984	0.3225
Yarmouth Water Department	900,000			0.3025		0.2490	0.2720

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE – 12 – 15%

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE – GAL.	BID PRICE PER GALLON					
Barnstable Fire District	2,000		3.9700			3.5888	no bid
Brewster Water Dept.	5,000		3.9700			3.9177	4.6000
Chatham DPW Sewer Division	10,000		3.9700			3.6492	7.6000
Chatham Water Division	7,000		3.9700			no bid	3.3500
Dennis Water District	8,000		3.9700			2.2655	no bid
Harwich	8,000		3.9700			No bid	no bid
Orleans Water Department	4,000		3.9700			3.1796 bulk / 3.3980 15g drums	4.6000
Provincetown Water Department	1,400 gallons (Bulk)		3.9700			no bid	no bid
	700 gallons - 15 gal. carboys		3.9700			3.8607	no bid
Yarmouth Water Department	500		3.9700			4.6825	no bid

Sodium Hydroxide, Liquid Solution: ie. Sodium Hydroxide Liquid – 50%

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE – GAL.	BID PRICE PER GALLON					
Chatham DPW Sewer Division	15,000					2.5544	2.0768

HYDRATED LIME

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE - LBS	BID PRICE PER LB.					
Brewster Water Dept.	56,000	0.2959	0.2970		0.3090	no bid	0.2954

CITRIC ACID – 50% Food Grade

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE - GAL.	BID PRICE PER GALLON					
Orleans Water Department	880	6.9777			9.9900	10.0300	no bid
Provincetown Water Department	250 gallons (15 gallon carboys)	14.8338			12.9900	no bid	no bid

METHANOL SOLUTION – 20%

WATER DEPARTMENT	ESTIMATED USAGE	BID PRICE PER GALLON					
Town of Chatham DPW Sewer Division	30,000				3.5900	no bid	no bid